BID TABULATION

ITB #19-22

"Gravel Rip Rap Products"
Charles Lindsey, Principal Buyer
Ph:205.325.5381

LINE NO.

1

2

GROUP I: GRAVEL & RIP RAP

PRODUCTS ITEMS

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

WADE EAST

THOMAS -

LOCATION

DOLICITO

LOCATION

LAKESHORE
/BESSEMER
LOCATION

HELENA

LOCATION

WADE EAST
THOMAS -
LOCATION

WADE SAND & GRAVEL CO., INC.

DOLICITO
LOCATION

LAKESHORE
/BESSEMER
LOCATION

HELENA
LOCATION

1 . 001 - Misc. Scrap $ $ $

2 No. 098 - Surge Pile NO BID $ 19251 $ 1925 | $ 19.251] $ 19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 No. 106 - Class 1 Rip Rap NO BID $ 2625 $ 26.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 No. 101 - Class 2 Rip Rap NO BID $ 26251 % 26.25 NO BID $ 20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 No. 108 - Class 3 Rip Rap (call Rep) NO BID $ 28.25 NO BID NO BID $ 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 No. 163 - 6-03" Gabion NO BID $ 26.25 NO BID NO BID $ 19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 No. 24 NO BID $ 2150 | $ 2150 [ $ 20.75] $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 No. 400, #4 NO BID $ 2150 $ 2150 | $ 20.75| $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 No. 467, #467 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 No. 477 - 825B DGB NO BID $ 1925 $ 1925 | $ 19.00] $ 17.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 No. 500, #5 NO BID $ 2150 | $ 2150 [ $ 20.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 No. 570, #57 NO BID $ 2150 $ 2150 | $ 20.75| $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 No. 599 - 11/2" C. S. B. NO BID $ 19251 $ 1925 | $ 19.001] $ 17.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 No. 600, #6 NO BID $ 2150 $ 21.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 No. 670, #67 NO BID $ 2150 $ 2150 $ 20.75] $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 No. 700, #7 NO BID $ 2150 | $ 24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 No. 780, #78 NO BID $ 2150 $ 2400 | $ 21.75| $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 No. 799 3/4" C. S. B. NO BID $ 19251 $ 1925 | $ 19.001] $ 15.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 No. 810, #810 NO BID $ 2400 $ 1850 | $ 19.00] $ 15.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 No. 811 - 8910 NO BID $ 2400 $ 1850 | $ 19.00] $ 15.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 No. 820- 1/4" MOD NO BID $ 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 No. 890, #89 NO BID $ 2400 $ 2400 | $ 21.75| $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 No. 892 - Stone Sand NO BID $ 1850 | $ 1850 | $ 19.00] $ 16.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

GROUP I - GRAND TOTAL $ - $ 480.65 | $ 40165 | $ 29575 $ 295.00 - $ -
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BID TABULATION

ITB #19-22

"Gravel Rip Rap Products"
Charles Lindsey, Principal Buyer
Ph:205.325.5381

1 2
WADE SAND & GRAVEL CO., INC. VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
LAKESHORE LAKESHORE
LINENO.  GROUP I1: GRAVEL & RIP RAP V¥AH%$\AEA§S_T DOLICITO  ,ggssemer  HELENA V¥AH%$\AEAASS_T DOLICITO BESSEMER HELENA
PRODUCTS ITEMS SN LOCATION | ocaTion  LOCATION o LOCATION LOCATION LOCATION
24 |8" x 3" Rip Rap-- NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 |#105 Manufactured Sand NO BID 3 1565 % 15655 15255 11.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 |#2 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 2150 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 |#24 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 2150 | $ 20.75 | $ 20.75 | $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 |#57 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 2150 | $ 20.75 | 20.75 | $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 |#67 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 2150 | $ 20.75 | $ 19.00 | $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 #610 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 1925 | $ 19.00 | $ 2175 % 15.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 |#78 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 2400 | $ 2175 | $ 2175 | $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 |#89 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 2400 | $ 2175 | $ 21.75 | $ 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 #810 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 1850 | $ 19.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 |#8910 Crushed Limestone NO BID $ 1850 | $ 19.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 |#825 -B Dense Graded Base NO BID $ 1925 | $ 19.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 17.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 |Class Il Rip Rap NO BID $ 26.25 | $ 2425| NOBID |$ 20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 |Class Il Rip Rap NO BID $ 2825| NOBID NOBID | $ 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
gg  |Mixed Stone (No Specific Gradation - any NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 11.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
and all sizes mixed)
GROUP Il GRAND TOTAL| $ - s 27965 | $ 22165  198.00 | $ 236.00 | $ - s - |8 -
GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1 & 11| $ - s 76030 | $ 62330 |$ 49375 | $ 531.00 | $ - s - |8 -
DELIVERY GUARANTEED - AFTER ORDER DATE NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED
REQUIRED FORMS
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT YES YES
EEOC YES YES
NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND YES YES
AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR YES YES
DEBARMENT STATEMENT NO SIGNATURE VES
SIGNATURE PAGE VES YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

1 Vulcan Materials Company - Southern and Gulf Coast Division | 1200 Urban Center Drive Birmingham, AL 35242 | Attn: Charles Smith | Ph: 205-234-3867 | Email: smithch@vmcmail.com
2 Wade Sand & Gravel Co.Inc. | P.O. BOX 39048 Birmingham, AL 35208 | Attn: Dwight Ingle | Ph: 205-324-6691| Email: dtingle@bham.rr.com | Fax: 205-323-4907
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